

BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Recommending Approval

RESOLUTION NO. 31(06-22)

WHEREAS, the PICC-BAC advertised, through posting in the Phil-GEPS, PICC Website and in the bulletin board of the BAC Secretariat, the Invitation to Bid for the **Supply and Delivery of Various Mechanical Supplies, Parts and Materials**, with a total Approved Budget for Contract (ABC) of **SIXTEEN MILLION NINE HUNDRED FORTY-THREE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED THIRTY-EIGHT PESOS AND FIFTY-ONE CENTAVOS (P16,943,838.51), VAT inclusive**, consisting of five (5) lots;

WHEREAS, in response to the said posting, five (5) suppliers, namely: PRIMEGOODS TRADING AND ELECTRICAL SUPPLY COMPANY ("Primegoods"), MANARA MARKETING ("Manara"), TRUE-TEMP CORPORATION ("True-temp"), VIVA SALES ENTERPRISES ("VSE") and MARELCO TRADING CORPORATION ("MTC"), obtained/paid for the bid documents. All bidders were declared eligible on May 23, 2023 and their bid proposal were as follows:

Description	Sub-ABC	True temp	VSE	Manara	MTC	Primegoods
Lot I – Equipment and Control Components	₱10,777,458.00	₱10,200,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	₱10,475,420.00
Lot II – York Chiller Consumable Materials	₱4,149,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	₱3,865,000.00
Lot III – Air-conditioning Consumables	₱998,523.49	₱990,000.00	₱909,616.00	₱926,934.00	₱918,905.00	₱969,718.00
Lot IV – Sewage Treatment Plant Consumable	₱112,076.22	No bid	₱90,868.00	₱100,800.00	No bid	₱76,025.00
Lot V – Materials /Equipment for Various Mechanical Works	₱906,780.80	₱880,00.00	₱866,692.00	₱904,754.00	No bid	₱822,168.00

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification by the Technical Working Group (TWG) of all the eligibility, technical and financial documents, as well as post-qualification documents submitted by the first ranked bidders, the BAC, in its meeting on June 19, 2023, found the bid offer submitted by True Temp for Lot I, Primegoods offers for Lots II, IV and V and VSE for Lot III, found to be complying and responsive;


Description	Sub-ABC	Name of Suppliers	Bid Offer	Variance	
				Amount	%
Lot I	₱10,777,458.00	True temp	₱10,200,000.00	₱577,458.00	5.36
Lot II	₱4,149,000.00	Primegoods	₱3,865,000.00	₱284,000.00	6.84
Lot III	₱998,523.49	VSE	₱909,616.00	₱88,907.49	8.90
Lot IV	₱112,076.22	Primegoods	₱76,025.00	₱36,051.22	32.17
Lot V	₱906,780.80	Primegoods	₱822,168.00	₱84,612.80	9.33

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED, the following:

- a) To recommend for approval to the PICC Executive Committee, the award to True-Temp of Lot I, as the bidder with the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid.

- c) To recommend for approval by General Manager, the award to VSE, which submitted the lowest calculated and responsive bids for Lot III, whose total offer of ₱909,616.00, is within the sub-ABC.

RESOLVED, at the PICC, this 19th day of June, 2023.


MELPIN A. GONZAGA
Chairman



ELIZABETH B. AGUILA
Vice-Chairperson


PERCIVAL M. SALONGA
Member


MARIA SOCORRO S. AVILA
Member


MARIO B. MACANAS
End-user

Approved on _____


RENATO B. PADILLA
General Manager