

**BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Recommending Approval**

**RESOLUTION NO. 051(08-21)**

WHEREAS, the PICC-BAC advertised, through posting in the Phil-GEPS, PICC Website and in the bulletin board of the BAC Secretariat, the Invitation to Bid for the Supply and Delivery of Various Mechanical Supplies, Parts and Materials consisting of seven (7) lots, with a total Approved Budget for Contract (ABC) of **TWELVE MILLION FIVE HUNDRED SIXTY-ONE THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED NINETY-ONE PESOS AND FIFTY-FIVE CENTAVOS (P12,561,991.55), VAT inclusive;**

WHEREAS, the sub-ABCs are as follows; **Lot I: Equipment Control Components** - THREE HUNDRED FORTY-SIX THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED FIFTY-NINE PESOS AND SIXTY CENTAVOS (**P346,959.60**); **Lot II: Air-conditioning System Parts and Accessories** - EIGHT MILLION FIVE HUNDRED TWO THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED THIRTY-FOUR PESOS AND FIVE CENTAVOS (**P8,502,134.05**); **Lot III: York Chillers Consumable Materials** - TWO MILLION EIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY-FIVE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED PESOS (**P2,855,600.00**); **Lot IV: Sewage Treatment Plant Consumables** - THIRTY-NINE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED EIGHTY-FIVE PESOS (**P39,585.00**); **Lot V: Mitsubishi Elevator Parts** - ONE HUNDRED TWENTY-TWO THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED NINETY-TWO PESOS AND FIFTY CENTAVOS (**P122,492.50**); **Lot VI - Kitchen Equipment Materials** - FOUR HUNDRED SEVENTY-TWO THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY PESOS (**P472,850.00**) and **Lot VII: Materials for Various Mechanical Works** - TWO HUNDRED TWENTY-TWO THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED SEVENTY PESOS AND FORTY CENTAVOS (**P222,370.40**);

WHEREAS, in response to the said posting, three (3) suppliers, namely: RCAC AIRCONDITIONING CORPORATION ("RCAC"), MANARA MARKETING ("MANARA") and PRIMEGOODS TRADING AND ELECTRICAL SUPPL CO. ("PRIMEGOODS") obtained/paid for the bid documents. All bidders were declared ELIGIBLE and their bid proposals were as follows:

Description	Sub-ABC	Primegoods	RCAC	Manara
Lot I: Equipment Control Components	P346,959.60	P345,730.00	No bid	No bid
Lot II: Air-conditioning System Parts and Accessories	P8,502,134.05	No bid	No bid	No bid
Lot III: York Chillers Consumable Materials	P2,855,600.00	No bid	P2,855,600.00	No bid
Lot IV: Sewage Treatment Plant Consumables	P39,585.00	P33,180.00	No bid	P38,600.00
Lot V: Mitsubishi Elevator Parts	P122,492.50	No bid	No bid	No bid
Lot VI - Kitchen Equipment Materials	P472,850.00	P450,000.00	No bid	P468,000.00
Lot VII: Materials for Various Mechanical Works	P222,370.40	P206,000.00	No bid	P222,340.00

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification by the Technical Working Group (TWG) of all the eligibility, technical and financial documents, as well as post-qualification documents submitted by the first-ranked bidders, the BAC, in its meeting on August 23, 2021, found the bid offers of Primegoods for Lots I, IV, VI and VII, and RCAC for Lot III, to be complying and responsive;

Description	Sub-ABC	Name of Suppliers	Bid Offer	Variance	
				Amount	%
Lot I	P346,959.60	Primegoods	P345,730.00	P1,229.60	0.35
Lot III	P2,855,600.00	RCAC	P2,855,600.00	0	0
Lot IV	P39,585.00	Primegoods	P33,180.00	P6,405.00	16.18
Lot VI	P472,850.00	Primegoods	P450,000.00	P22,850.00	4.83
Lot VII	P222,370.40	Primegoods	P206,000.00	P16,370.40	7.36

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE, as it is hereby RESOLVED, to recommend to the PICC General Manager the following:

- a) Award to Primegoods which submitted the lowest calculated and responsive bid for Lots I, IV, VI and VII, whose total offer of ₱345,730.00, ₱33,180.00, ₱450,000.00 and ₱206,000.00 respectively, are within the sub-ABC;
- b) Award to RCAC, which submitted the lone calculated and responsive bid for Lot III whose total offer of ₱2,855,600.00, is within sub-ABC;
- c) To declare a Failed Bid for Lots II and V, and schedule a **RE-BID to** for such requirement.

RESOLVED, at the PICC, this 23<sup>rd</sup> day of August, 2021.

  
MELPIN A. GONZAGA  
Chairman

  
ELIZABETH B. AGUILA  
Vice-Chairperson

  
MARIA SOCORRO S. AVILA  
Member

  
PERCIVAL M. SALONGA  
Member

  
MARIO B. MACANAS  
End-user

Approved on \_\_\_\_\_

  
RENATO B. PADILLA  
General Manager